
JtPPROVED 
APP !CATION WILDLAND URBAN INTERFACE FUELS REDUCTION PROGRAM 

APPLICATION FOR INCENTIVES PROGRAM 

PROJECT NUMBER: 71 ;0-001-zc 

NAME: €OW I A/ /_ U 0/ ff 
ADDRESS: ,-Yo &iY.. 95 Cf 

City: L f1- Po~ !CZ- State: L.o 
Zipcode: 8 0 5 3S-

TELEPHONE NO: Cf70 t./ "6""'Z...· 5"'e..f (J {/ 491 7D I 0 

(For Official Use Only) 

z.oDL 

PROJECT LEGAL DESCRIPTION: / 0-V b:wt~ (?ultk C-{;-
PRACTICE OBJECTIVE: 12 All / -

~ vu~ / t:....o 8'"D~ 1 ::i. 
4~.,q..-p 

START DATE: WI\~ l(Jm} Q,V~ (e,ad'1 
COMPLETION DATE: r'f=s ft p (No later than Sept. i, 2002) 

Practice Title Quantity 
Requested 

Quantity 
Approved 

Rate C/SAmount C/SAmount 
Requested Approved 

5 4 $200 $1000 800 

(J() 
Total Amount Approved: -----

Request for cost-share assistance under this program is to meet the objective stated above. If cost-
sharing is approved for the requested practice, I agree to cover expenses at the time of implementation, 
knowing I will be receiving cost-share funds not exceeding 50% of actual cost.( Examples: if actual cost 
of the example above is $1600, cost-share reimbursed is $800, the approved amount. If the actual cost is 
$1200, the reimbursement is $600. If the actual cost is $2, 000, a cost-share payment of $800 is made. I 
understand that I will not be reimbursed for any expenses incurred prior to approval of my application. I 
also understand that the practice needs to be completed by Septembe 2002. 

LANDOWNER SIGNATURE:_k,.-.£. .... - =--+-·~--~-"''---:--~--- DATE: 

C/S APPROVED: $ ·z_; ()O 

DATE: ! -2 -()(__ 

Program eligibility is without r ard to e, color, religion, national origin, age, sex, marital status or 
disability. For more information contact the Colorado State Forest Service at (970) 491-6303. 
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WILDLAND URBAN INTERFACE FUELS REDUCTION 
INCENTIVES PROGRAM PROJECT PLAN 

€ow1N LuGl4 e4-f2B4Rl1 Lv01 cl - Us-~&n5'4-___________________ 
Landowner/HOA 

Street or PO Box 

City, State, Zip Code 

170 Y~<- ~-4~~ 
Telephone Number 

Resource Professional Date 

Address Telephone# 

The Wildland Urban Interface Incentives Program project plan, prepared at 
my request, reflects objectives that I have for my property to reduce 
hazardous fueis. It contains implementatiGn recommendations that have been 
reviewed with me by a natural resource professional. 

Landowner Date 

cw 
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WILDLAND URBAN INTERFACE FUELS REDUCTION PROGRAM 
PROJECT PLAN ILLUSTRATION 

Sketch project area. Include structures and landmarks. Indicate, by location, 
fuels reduction practices to be implemented. Where appropriate, illustrate 
distances. Illustrate road access. 

;Jproy CJ~ a cre S of (~J T N 
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-----~--- ---·- ___ , ______ -·-----·----------- -- ____.., 

Please provide any other valuable information: 

FOREST 
SERVICE 
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WILDLAND URBAN INTERFACE FUELS REDUCTION PROGRAM 
PROJECT PLAN 

OBJECTIVES: What do you want to achieve by this practice? (if more than one objective list 
priority) 
Example: To decrease hazardous fuels around my home and improve forest health). 

a Y\'€,ce) + ~ 'r'\ o-ur ~ es.f- 6 7 Z1f?n=>o< 7 (; /o 
e, f-1-i~ 6uY t'\ f 11 r Crl ~I/) reK'Y#t:Nb/I 

PROJECT LEGAL DESCRIPTION: Section: T 
-~~- -~~~-

R -----
(treatment area) 

PLEASE DESCRIBE THE CURRENT CONDITIONS OF THE TREATMENT AREA: 
(Vegetation, Soils, Water, Wildlife, etc. , as appropriate for planning purposes, and how treatment 
will affect these resources. Address T & E species/habitat if appropriate. Please use additional paper 
ifneeded.) _p i 

GTUY ( t:.N"ec; t- I ~ crve-r' rr~ 6 ~ 
f'r1 1 .e, Jn:; e f t5 e:~:vl1 es f1 'ef!AJ e M a e ~ "'i ~ , 

LIST PRACTICE WITH PROJECTED COMPLETION DATE: 



FWD: Ol!tstanding 2002 WUI Grants - Message 
"' ·~\rt. I ' ~ WebMail - FWD: Outstanding 2002 WUI Grants 

Date Sent: Thursday, August 12, 2004 9:08 AM 

From: "Kathy Porter" <kporter@lamar.colostate.edu> 

To: INorland Hall <nhall@lamar.colostate.edu>, 3 
Subject: FWD: Outstanding 2002 WUI Grants 

Status: I r Urgent I New 

Hi Norland, could you please check on this. 

cc: Elizabeth, Norland is in the field today and not due back til late 
p.m. His first chance to check into this won't be until Friday. Kathy 

[ Add to Address Book 

-----Original Message -----From: "Rich Homann" <rhomann@lamar.colostate.edu> 
To: "Kathy R. Porter" <kporter@lamar.colostate.edu> 
Cc: "Elizabeth Bright" <eabright@msn.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, August 11 , 2004 1 :25 PM 
Subject: FW: Outstanding 2002 WUI Grants 

> Kathy, 
> 
> Knowing now that Dave is on AL, if this is something you or Norland has 
> knowledge of please respond to Elizabeth. If you don't know we'll just 
> wait for Dave to get back. 
> 
> Rich 
> 
> -----Original Message-----
> From: Elizabeth Bright [eabright@msn.com] 
> Sent: Wednesday, August 11 , 2004 1 : 12 PM 
> To: dfarmer@lamar.colostate.edu 
> Cc: rhomann@lamar.colostate.edu 
> Subject: Outstanding 2002 WUI Grants 
> 
> Hi Dave 
> 
> I just wanted to drop you a note to remind you that we still need to 
> hear 
> about 2002 WUI grant number: 
> 
> 7110-001-20: Edwin Lucia, approved for $2100, phone # 970.482.5462. 
> 
> Has Mr. Lucia done the work or is the work in progress or has he 
> canceled 
> the project? Please let me know by Friday, August 13 , or we may end up 
> putting those funds toward other projects. 

https ://webmail . col ostate.edu/MBX/nhall/ID=411 DC3 BI /MSG: 9 
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FWD: Outstanding 2002 WUI Grants - Message 
I t 

' 
> 
> Thanks for your help. 
> 
> Elizabeth Bright 
> Jan Hackett & Rich Homann's assistant 
> 970.491.6303 
> eabright@msn.com 

tlJ Secure mode active . 
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13AUG2004 

Re: Edwin Lucia 2002 WUI Grant No. 7110-001-20. 

I called Mr. Lucia on 1010 13AUG2004 at 482-5462. He told me that he had 
completed the 2002 project and had received a check for $1 ,800. 

Norland Hall 
Forester 


